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^
^ew Eel hi, this the S day of 1996

Hon'bleOr. x\.K.« Saxena. Membez < J )
Hon*ble iVlr. K. r/iuthukumar, Member ( A )

Shri Bharam Pal Sirigh Shri Ganqa ,
i-i/o Village and Post Office Luckhsara Histt.
Q^aziabad.

APPLl CAl^ T

( ihiough Mr . Shanker Raju for the applj cartt }

Vs,

1. --elhi Administration, through the Chief
Se ar e ta ry, 01 «i Se or e tar i a t, 'u el hi ,

2. The Gommisslonei of Police, Lei hi rcli ce,
He»d Oiai ter, Heao: i.I.O., New Del^i.

Commisslonei of Poll cetnarge),
el hi Poll ce Head vuai ter, nedi I. T.c.

New el hd.. '

4,. i^he AdditioMdl Leputy Commissioner,
n ti al L i st t, Kew Del hi .

HESFC'IL EH IS

1 Ih rough Mr dui at Singh, Advocate )

0 U L. £ B

Delivered by Hon>ble Di . h.k. Saxena. ;viemher 'j. )
To challenge the order of punishment

(Annex.re A-l), the appellate order Umexaie h-3)^
the order passed in revi sion(Annexui e A-5) and
order on petition to the it

o ^vexnor, is filed
thi s 0»/ \ •

^
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2. Briefly stated the facts of the case

aie tnat the aplplicant Ehaiam Pal dingh was s-^iving

as a Constable in Celhi Police. In the year 1987,

he was iaosted at Anand Prabat Police station. On

the night of i6/i7th Octobei, 1987, this applicant

alongwitn Head Constable Paj cangh, Constable

iMranjan Singh and Constable nohtash Sir,gh were

on picket duty from 12*© clock in the night to

8.00 a.m. on the I\ew JRohtak fioad. It is said

that Sh. f\j ay Chadha, Ly. Commissioner of Poli ce

(D CP) .fS/est Listri ct,Del hi was also on i:>«.trf l diitx .

The Driver of the Tn-ck bo. KJV 6921 stopped the

truck on nazafgarh-[\anglci Road seeing the vehicle

of the D.C.P. On enquiry, the driver of the

aforesaid truck infoxTned that the vehicles are

often stopped by the Police f^ersonnels on picket
duty in the night and the trucks are allowed to go
only ^fter accepting illegal gi ati fi cation, which
is also called 'entry fee'. On receivirg this
ir foiaiatic.n. dhri Hj uy Chadha boarded the truck
and got hiaiself seated behirid the driver of the
truck. He signed dne currency note of te.io/- and
handed over the same to the truck-driver with the
instruction that the truck should be stop. ed only
-hen signalled by the .ooliceeien. t,
directed that on demand by the police-men, ne
ithe dtruck driver ^ve-, should give the currency note
of Bs.iO/-, which was sianed h\ h-;sig..ea by him. After having
»celved these Instruc tiers, the trucK-drl..„u
stated towards Hohtaknoad. when the sale tr.ck
reached near New jRohtwi n ^_^htak Koad, Where the puket party

I) • e . . . pg. 3/«
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of Anand Paxbat Police station was on duty, one

constable, whose name was subsequently came to the

notice of Stai Chadha, UCP as Braham Pal iiingh,

signalled the tiuck driver to stop the truck and

demanded entry fee. Consequently, the truck-drivei

stopped the truck and handed over the signed curiency
note of te.JD/- to the said Braham Pal Singh - the

applicant. The driver of tl-ie truck demanded balance

of the money back and thereupon the applicant reluct-

antly returiiKl the^tTtf as.5/-. Anothsr truck .vMch
> was already standing near the picket party, started

after this Truck No.i-UV 692i reached. It is said that

the police constable also tried to ascertain as to who
were other persons on the s.at behind the diiver of
the truck. Shri Ajay Chadha, however, came down
of the truck and searched the person of Consta.ble
Braham Pal dingh-the appli cant; ano few name plates
one of dunder dingh and the other of Braham Pal Singh

^ were recovered. Some curiency notes, which amounted
- 'bout !s.122/_ including signed currency note, were

found lying on the ground where Constable Braham Pal
Singh was standing. The LCP Shri Aj ay Chadha t hen
went to the Police dtaUon, Anand PdsAat and got an
entry made about the occurrence. The currency notes
were also handed over and got the», sealed in one envelope.

Thereupon the constable Braham Pal dingh
was put under suspension and he was departraentally
proceeded af ter a few formalities in the matter.
Shri Bhagwant Singh, Inspector was made the inquiry
Officer. He proceeded with the inquiry because the

.P9.4/-
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charges were denied by the applicant. Four witnesses,

namely, Constable Uinesh Kumar, Inspector Lai Cingh,

i.I. Shyam Lai and Chri Aj ay Chadha, DCP were examinee.

The written defence statement was furnished by the

applicant. On consideration of the material available

on record, the Inquiry Officer held the charge

levelled against the applicant and others, proved.

Thereupon, the AddlXi>CP served show-cause notice

on the applicant, who again submitted his written

reply. The Adol J) CP consideiimg all tlie points,

passed impugned order Annexure A-l on 23.1.1989

whereby the applicant was dismissea from service.

4. The applicant preferred an appeal

Annexure A-2 against the order of punishnent which

was disposed of on Ob.7.i989 by Addl, Commissioner

of Police by rejecting the same. It appear s that

the applicant thereupon preferred revision petition
to the Commissioner of Lelri Police. Cince it was

preferred beyond the period of limitation, the same
was rejected on 29.9.1989. The applicant then

submitted representation to Hon'ble Lt. Governor,
wfiich was also rejected. Hence, this 0.A. was filed.

It has been contended on behalf of the applicant that

there was suppression of material evidence in the
case by not producing the two drivers. Also, no
lecovery memo of the currency note^^which was
allegedly given or taken by the applicant was

prepared and the order of punisrment was passed
by .n authority, «hich «as lo.«r in rank tl;a. the
appointing authority Tt i c x-.v +ua uL.wiixy. it ii, further contendea that
the order in appeal is not a speakin" arn

^ SKt'aKrriy ano reasoneu
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Older as is required under law. Therefore, the

quashnent of them is sought.

5. The respondents have contested the case

on several grounds including the point on limitation.

It is averred that the order in appeal was passed

on 05.7.89. Even the representation which was pre-

feireo to the (Sommissioner of Police^Was decided on

27.9.39, yet the O.A. was not preferred within the

Uf prescribed period of limitation. It is also the case
• - • r

\

of the resppndents that there is no provision for

filing a repr esentation to the Lt. Governor and

the applicant cainnot get the ibenefit of the time

spent in the disFOosal of the representation by the

Lt. Governor. Even if it is taken into consideiation,
then also the Q.a. was preferred beyond the period

of limitation of one year from the date when the

order rejecting the representation was passed by the
^ Lt. Governor.

It is also pleaded that the orders of
punishmient were passed legally and theie was no illega
lity therein. The plea taken is that the appointing
authority is the DCP and the Addl. DCP exercised the

powers ano, therefore, cntendithat there is no
force in the O.A.

applicant filed rejoinder re-iteiating
the facts, which were narrated in the O.A.

the learned counsel for
the parUes and have perused the record i"tl"ding
the file of the Inquiry Officer.

pg-o/-
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The first point, which is of primary

importance is whether the O.A. has been filed within

the period of limitation. It is an admitted fact

that the order of punishioent was passed on 23.1.1989,

while the order in appeal was passed on 05.7.1989. It

is also clear from the record, particularly, Annexure A-5

thai the applicant had preferred a revision which was

rejected on 29 . 9.1989 for two reasons. First,, was that

it Was not filed within time, and second was that no

cogent reasons were disclosed. It is also the achsitted

fact to both the parties that the applicant bad preferred

a representation to the l.t. Governor whicbi was also

rejected. The date of giving representation . to the

<Lt. Cbvernor has not been given by the applicant but

the respondents disclosed in the counter-replv that

the rejection of the re present®tion made to the

Lt. Governor, was informed to the applicant through

registered letter no.20CX)6-8/HAP/C dated 26.3.1990.

The letter must have been served within a fortnight

or so, of the date of issue* Thus* the limitation.

according to the learned counsel for the applicant.

should run thereafter. He further contends that the

applicant is a poor person and could nor arrange money

for preparation of his case*, through a lawyer and there

fore the delay was caused. Ibe argument on behalf of

the learned counsel fgr the respondents is that there

is no provision fox revision to the Commissioner of

Police and representation to the Hon'ble Lt. Governor,

and, therefore, the time which was spent in these

proceedings, cannot be excluded, We are not convinced

with this argument. A person who is not conversant with
r\ , 9
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the procedural provisions of law and particularly

of limitation, shall act only on the advice of

other i.e. a lawyer. It he was advised to file

a revision and then to file representation to the

Lt. Governor, his banafide<s cannot be doubtid. The

learned counsel for the applicant pointed out that

it Was the common practice to have moved i epresentdtion

to the Lt. Governor and that practice was adopted

by the applicant. In oar opinion, the time whi d:

j was spent in prosecuting the remedy by way of

revision or i epresentation should be excluded.

The only point comes that by the end of March, 1990

the applicant must have been conveyed the rejection

of representation by the Lt. Covernoi, and in that

si tuition jthis O.A. must have been filed vdthin one

year therefrom. It appears fiorn the perusal of the

record that this O.A. was filed on 07.8.1991. Thus,
there is a delay of about four months. In view of

the facts as are narrated by the applicant in the

application for condonation of delay, we allow the
same and the O.A. is taken for consideration.

contention of the learned, counsel
for the applicant is that there is no indeperwent
eVicente in the matter, he emphatically pointed out
that the Lxiver of the Irick which w.s allegedly stopped
by the applicant and illegal giatificaUon in the name
of entiy fee,was dananded.and currency note of Rs.lO/-
was given, has not been examined, .le have already
condldered this aspea during the narration of the
facts of the case, and it was clear that ^

• •...e, pq.8/-
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witnesses incluoing Shri Aj ay Chadha, dCP were examined.

Other witnesses are of formal character. They stated

about the departure of the applicant alongwith others

on picket-duty of about the recovery memo.having been

prepared. Shri Ajay Chadha is the eye witfeess of the

occurrence. It is not the case of the applicant that

there was no evidence at all. n'hat he contends is

that the truck-diiver was not examined and the statement

of Shri ay Chadha shoulo not be believed because

he failed to make the recovery memo, of the currency

notes including the currency note of 8s.JO/- which

was allegedly given by the truck driver to the appli-

cant; and was found on the grouno. It is also contenaeo

that the recovery memo, was prepared at the Police

otatlon. It is, therefore, argued that the provisions

of Code of Criminal Procedure have been ignored. Ifie
learned counsel for the applicent is trying to make
this case a case prosecuted in the Criminal Court.
Ihe procedure given in the Code of Criminal Procedure,
IS meant for the trials which are conducted in the
criminal courts. Ihe strict rule of proof and the
benefit of doubt are the principles adopteo in those
cases, we are of the view that those strict principles
of aiminal liability are not appUcshle in the cases
under disciplinary proceedings. S.hii Ajay Chadha was
aa.C.P.-a responsible officar-and wt,at he had seen
himself, cir.not be brushed aside lightly. rhe statement
of Shri Ajay Qiadha can.not be discarded for the simple
reason that the recovery memo, was not prepared. As
the .matter of appreciation of evidence is not permiss-
ible foi the Tribunal ox the i-ii nh r/-.- fxne iiiyh Court, we therefore.
do not want to tj^ess owce • a.

into that field
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'Whatever we have mentioned earlier was by way of

illustration because the argument for disbelieving

Shri Ajay C^adha was advanced. It is also a cardinal

principle that the disciplinary autlcrities are the

best judges for the proper appreciation of evidence.

Our jurisdiction lies in judicial review in which

it is to be seen if any procedural defect was there

or not. The learned counsel for the applicant could

not point out any procedural defect in recording the

^ evidence or in appreciation thereof. — He is also not

in a position to establish that it was a case of

•no evidence*. In view of these facts, the contention
that the charges are not established against the
applicant, does not hold goofl,

argued that the DW is the appolntir
authority of tte applicant, and therefore, the punistoe
can be awarded only by the appointtng authority, m
this oonnection our attention has been drawn to Section
12 Of the Delhi Police Act. 1978 which deals with
the appoinbeent of certain ranks. Acoerding to this
lacUon. Suh,inspectors of Police other than the
cfficers of subordinate ranks, maj be appointed by
theDCPs Of Police, AddIJJ CPs. aPrincipal of Police
Training College or of the Police Gaining Scho, 1or
any other police officer of eguivalent rank. According
to the argunent advanced by the learned counsel for
the applicant. Dy. CoMiasioner of Police is the
appoinUng authcrrity of the applicant whn—le. ithasnotheens:::::!::;:;:,
respondents that Addliia. has be^ treated or shown
equivaient in the rank of DCP u .^ DCP. He further contends
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that even if it is assumea that he was equivalent

in rank of CiCP, he was not competent to pass the

order of punishoent of major penalty. In this

connection, our attention has been drawn to Hule 6

of idelhi Poli ce(Puni slment and Appeal) Pules, 1980..

It is mentioned here that the punishment mentioned

in Sr.4N0.vi) to (vii) of Pule 5 shall be deemed to

be major penalty and may be awarded by an officer

of the rank of the appointing authorixy or above

after a regular departmental inquiry. In part-il

of Pule 6, ilCP arid above are made competent to

inflict punishtneiit upon a Inspector and below whereas

Adai. DGP can impart punisrment against a Constable

and Sub-Inspector in the cases of minor penalty.

Qismissal from service is a majom penaity and according
to flule 6 it can be passed only by a DCP and above.

In the present case, the penalty has been imposed by
Addl. oeputy Gommi ssio.ner of Police. In this way. It
has been contended on behalf of the applies, t that the
order of punishment •which Has passed by the Ad.il. Deputy
Qom-missloner of Poiic, is illegal and non-sustair.able
in law. Learned counsel for the responoents simply
argued without showing any law on the point that
Mditional Deputy Gommi ssioner of Poll ce, Delhi could
exercise all the pw,ers of Deputy Commissioner of Police.
Howavr, the law laid down in ihe case nam Kishan Vs.
Union of Indi^ J.T. 1995(7) q r a -i;>.c. 4u' cam® to our noUce
durrncj dictation of Judgment. In this case, the
question whether Additional Deputy Cbmmissioner of
Police, Qelhi was competent to exercise powers of
Of GCP, was involve^d. Their Lordships of dupreme Court

same

Pg.ii/-



ii

in this case held that the order of dismissal from

service for gross mi scondu ct, was passed By Addl.

Deputy Commissioner of Police who was competent

to pass the said order. In this connection, their

Lordships considered the provisions of Delhi Police

(Punishment and Appeal )iiule s, 1980, Delhi Police act,
1978 and General Qauses Act, 1887. The view taken

by their Lordships is that where a superior officer

has been authorised to perform some duties under an

Act or a regulation, a subordinate or deputy officer

lawfully performing those duties in the place of his

superior^ is equally empowered to perform the duties

of the office of tie superior. It is further made

clear that r.ule 4 of the Delhi Poli ce(appointraent

and recruitment) Pules 1980 states that not only
the Deputy Gommissioner but, Addl^Veputy Commissioner
also has been delegated the pov^r of aF^ointing
Gub-Inspectors. Assistant Gub-Inspe ctor s. Head Con
stables and Constables. An Add!. Deputy Comrni ssione
IS, thus, competent to pass an order of dismissal,
in view of iaw so lai^d down in ham Kishan's case, the
facts of which are with similar to that of the case
of tte present applicant, is a^li cabl c; in
this case. Ihe result, therefore, is that the order
of punishment passed by the Addl. Deputy Comuussioner
of Police, cannot be said to be illegal.

It is also contenoed that the order in
appeal has not been passeo hv ^Hasseu oy a reasoned order. Ihe
-in ground is that the reply .,hich was sub.ines Ir
pursuance of the shc^cause noUce. was not discussed

tt^refore. the order passed in appeal was also not

r
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legal. -Ve have given caieful thought to this situation

and find that the order in appeal was no dcubu cry

ptic but, this fact alone will not be sufficient to

hold the order of puriish"nent illegal. The reasoned

order had been passed by the Punishing Authority and

if, the Appellate Authority agrees with the view

of the Punishing Authiority, detailed order is not

required to be passed. we have not seen any aefect

of that nature in the order of the Punishing Authority.

Thus, this ground also does not hold good.

13. In view of the facts ar'id circu:astunces

of the case as are discussed above, we do not sde any

ground to take a different view than was taken by the

departmental authorities. we do not see any merit in

the case of the applicant an«i as such it stands

dismissed. The O.'A. is decided accordingly. I'nIo

order as to costs.

/
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